
 
 

Care & Cleaning Operation 
   
Soap Dispensers 

 
Soap tanks, valves, and globes should be cleaned periodically to avoid sludge and soap build up, thus 
promoting better operation. This is especially important since the majority of operational issues for soap 
dispensers are due to improper maintenance and lack of cleaning. When soap dispensers are left 
unmaintained for long periods of time, the soap dries out and clogs the valves, causing the mechanism to leak 
or clog. While cleaning, do not remove or take valves apart as this creates problems with the seals and may 
cause a bypass leak. Flush valves with warm water. If the water does not flow through the valve after cleaning, 
repeat the procedure until it does.  
 
Take care to make sure you are using the right soap in your soap dispensers. The proper viscosity is 
imperative for trouble free operation. Coconut oil soaps should be the only products used in liquid valve soap 
dispensers. We recommend that you use a standard liquid, non-chloric soap, which should be mixed in a 
solution of one part water to one part soap. We recommend free-flowing, thin viscosity soaps only. Please 
consult us for more information on soaps that we recommend for your dispenser. 
 

JetAir Hand Dryers 
 

Begin the cleaning procedure by disconnecting the electrical supply. Using the allen key supplied, remove all 
tamper-resistant screws and lift the cover of the dryer off of the base. Clear dust and lint from the inside of the 
machine and cover. When you have finished cleaning, reinstall the cover onto the base and secure with 
tamper-resistant screws. Wipe cover with a damp cloth; do not use abrasive cleaners. Clean the inner cover 
and internal mechanism periodically to ensure proper operation. 
 

Mirrors 
 

Wipe mirrors with a soft cloth, taking special care to rub stainless steel frames with the grain to avoid 
scratching. Reflective surfaces can be cleaned with a non-abrasive glass cleaner and a soft cloth. When 
cleaning, care must be taken to avoid allowing the cleaner to run down the mirror and collect in the frame. If a 
cleaning agent and/or still water is allowed to sit in a frame or on the back of a mirror, this will lead to 
delamination of the protective coating and/or mirror silver, voiding the AJW warranty. Do not use abrasive 
cleaners containing ammonia, active chlorites, acetic acid or other harsh chemicals on stainless steel frames; 
mild, ammonia-free cleaning products are ideal. 
 

Stainless Steel Cabinets 
 

Wipe stainless steel cabinets with a soft cloth, rubbing with the grain to prevent scratching the surface. Do not 
use abrasive cleaners containing chloric solutions on stainless steel; Formica or window cleaning products are 
ideal.  
 
NOTE: The grain of our stainless steel cabinets runs in a vertical direction.  
 

Baby Changing Stations 
 

Units should be cleaned once or more daily with a clean nylon brush and spray disinfectant. 
 


